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If thou woulda'tread a htoon that Will keep   Thy heart from fainting and thy soul from sleep,    Go to the wood* and hills.-Longfellow. 
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L. M. McCLtKTH , 

A.TTOUNKY AT-LAW, 

Jlarliuton,    W.   Va , 

Will practice in tbe courts of Po- 
cahouia* and adjoining' counties 
aud iu the Supreuie Court of Ap- 
ueali'. 

T. S. MoNEEL, 

ATTOKNKY-AT-LAW, 

Marlinton,    Wwt    VirgiLia. 

Prompt Mttentiou   to all legal 
n-ss placed in his hands 

jT^wTTKAuTsSr" 
ATT0biBY-iT LAW, 

Marlinton,  W. Va. 

*■ n 

H 

N. C.McNell, G. V. McNefl. 
McNElL, « McNEIL, 
Attorneys-at-Law, 

Marlinton, West Virginia, 

Will practice in the courts of Po- 
cahontas aud adjoiuing counties 
and in tlio Court of Appeal's of 
the Stat« of West Virginia. 

* L VANS1CKLER, 

Allorney-al'Lav, 

LawiaBDBa, W. VA 

fracticta a   Creenbner and a' 

• oiinz countits 

*   HJLIMOXD HILL, 
nt.orney  at- taw and Notary 

Public, 
AOADEMY. W. VA 

Will practice in all the courts of 
Pocahontas and adjoining oountieB 
tnd Supreme Court of Appeals. 

<5eo. R. Rlahnrdson, 
jUtomey-nt Liacu, 

MARLINTON, W. VA 

Prompt  and   careful   attention 
given   to   all business placed in 

their hands. 

"DRTEKNEST  B.   HILL, 

Graduate University of Maryland. 
Denistry practiced in all its bran- 

ches. ' 

Office in It* Nat   Bank BiJg. 2nd floor 
t 

.   A. M. OLIVKB, 

NOTARY   PUBLIC, 
CABFBSTBE & CoNTUACTOB. 

Durbin, W. Va. 

The Doing 

BY Birrn a. D. HAVHI. 

To trv is  better than   the   tbing 

you try for, 
To hop 3   is   higher   than   the 

height attained, 
To love ia greater  than the love 

yon sigh for, 
To seek is nobler than the   ob- 

ject gained. 
To  "wrestle   with   the  ai 

—this avai's, 
Although  the   motive     for"   the 

anstling fails. 

To learn is more   esaenjial   than 
the knowing; 

To know is  deeper   than   the 
wisdom found; 

To live is grander than  all   life"! 
bestowing, 

To advance, more' fruitful ti|fto 
the vantage ground, 

To give is far more  blessed  than 
receiving, 

To toll the   truth   needs   not 
force believing.. 

To  speak is   voice   enternal 
vibration, 

To blaze a trail is   safer   than 
hewn road; 

To think is power, of infinite crea 
tion, 

To trust is finer   than   to   see 
jour God, 

To   th:
nk—to   act—these   bridge 
the world's abysses; 

To die!    No soul has told a soul 
what this is. 
—Pearson's Magazine. 
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■I viiUN-roN, W. V., 

I'.irmhontHB and adjoin- 
.,, '»i    npl -uiH posefoi 

.,„,.i fc'ivu   to  nil   letral work. 
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■ ;i.-.sr<>N       FEED WALLACE 

.,   „.-iLL?Wk 

^ itiiriieys-al-Law, 
LBW18BURO. W   VA. 

•TTKRIi, 

-ue.v -at - law and Notary 
niihlic 
MARLINTON, W. VA. 

aiU oMeitee   in   the   courts   of 
Poo h.»ntas county and in the Su- 
preme   '.act of Appeals. 

If .'II   LOCKBID.QB, 

•v tt.orney-al-LttW, 
HUNTffRSVILLE, W. VA. 

Pr.»uv>     *aA   careful    attention 
*iven to all legal work. 

WILLIAMS & DUNCAN,  , 

CIVIL     ENGINEERS, 

tat Nat. Ba-jk Building, 
Marlinton, W. Va. 

. »Uh ti) 'phone and mail prompt- 
ly answered. 

"DRGTATRE\
T
ERC6MB, 

Ronceverte, W. Va., 

. Will be at Case 1st and 3rd. Sat 
urdavs of each month. 

*~WTA. BRATTON, 

ATTORNEY-AT-LA W, 

MABLINTOS, W.  VA. 

Will practice in  the Courts  of 
the   State   and    Supreme   Con 
of Appeals. 

ALEXMDER MILL & SUPPLY CO 
MABHiWSTS, ETC 

Plaibltg. Staan Ftttlng. Heating. S'ui 
and Hot Witir. 

AH Kiads of Mieblaa Work- 

flARLilTOI.    •    •    -  •    W-W 

C. LTJ. Coanen'e 

TOfUOSIAU    PflRIiO*, 

■far*, r. n«|Mti'i Groesrr tu>r». 

The Eternal Fitneas of Things, 
An exchange comes out with an 

article giving the former residence 
and occupation. of those who are 
imueliately connected with the 
Indian management. It will le 
seen that they are, almost withou' 
an exception, from the Atlantic 
coast, where they have had abom 
the eame opportunity to become 
acquainted with the duties per 
taiuing to their appointment at 
Lucifer has had for the two thous- 
and years to form a warm person- 
al i-cjuaintance with the prophel 

haiah. 
With all due respect to th< 

worthy descendants ot tie Pilgrim 
Fathers, and not wishing to cast.a 
i-lar upon the ability or the integ 
rity of the dwellers along the rod 
bound coast of New England, 1 
will say in the mildest mannei 
possible that theBe men are n< 
more fit to manage hostile Indiai, 
than Perdition is natural'y fitted 

for a powder house. 
A man  m»y   successfully cop« 

with the wild   aud   fierce codfish 
in his native jungle,  or beard tht 
salt water clam   in   his  den, and 
still signally fail as an   Indian a- 
gfcn t.    The cod fish is not treacher- 
ous.    He may/be    bold,    blood 
thirsty and te/rible,   but  he will 
never go* backVou a treaty.    Who 

ever heard .of a codfish going back 
on bis word? Who ever beard of a 
codfish  leaving the Reservation 
and spreading desolation ovei the 
land? No ore-    The expression on 
the face of a codfish Bhowstbat be 
is perfectly open and above board. 

We might say the same of the 
clam.    Of course if driven to the 
wall, as it were, he will fight; but 
we have*' yet to   find a single in- 
stance  in   the   annals of 1 UtJrj 
where ihe   clam  unlesB    groeilj 
inanltod   and  openly pnt   upon, 
ever made open outbreak. 

This is   why the clam culture 
and Indian   management are not 
analogous."   They are not  simul 
taneous nor co-extensive.    Tbey 
are not i.lentical or homogeneous. 

I ft el that in treating  this sub- 
jectin my candid and truthful way 
perhaps the Administration will 
feel hurt and  grieved; but if so 1 
can't help it.    The great reading 
public seems to  look   to me, as 
much as to eay: "What are your 
views on this great sudject which 

is agitating the public   mind?"   I 
can,t evade it,   and even if Presi- 
dent Hayes wore an own brother, 
instead of being a warm, personal 
friend and adnrrer, 1   would cer 
tainly speak ritfbt ojit  as      bare 
spoken out, and 
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Facts  About Furs 

It is astonishing how keenly in- 
formed every •pCTtoa feeiuM© be 
who tonehee a pieca of far from Oa 
trap to counter. The Indians of 
Alaska know the results of tbe 
last London sales; for the first 
vessel opcoast takes tbe price lists 
to them, and then the news travels 
io tbe strange way of the wilderness 
When tbe trasler. say from Chica- 
go, makes his trip to tbe Keoai 
peninsula of Alaska, be finds that 
the Indiana will not take goods- 
they will have nothing but cash, 
and they want plenty of it Tbey 
know tbe prices as well as he, and 
tbey make them stiff enough and 
hold out lorg enough. Most of 
the fur collecting in that countiy 
is done by the local trader, who 
has some sort of post or store, and 
who makes tbe customers fur- 
trader's profit of a hundred per 
cent on his goods The Chicago 
man will buy of this local trader, 
who makes most of his money out 
of his goods. If the trader does 

not play fair, the Indians knaw 
there is" another one across the 
divide or down another river. 

Where are the far countries now 
that the American West   Is gone? 
Since we do   not   own    Siberia. 
Alaska is the. best for country left 
us.    Wo get fox,  sable, marten. 
lynx and bear in quantities  from 
Alaska.    There are some   Alaska 
i»landi on  which  private parties 
ure running for farms, raising blue 
fox fur,    with   varying   success. 
Fc rm ;rry traders ooold -bring out 
moose beads from   Alaska, and a 
giant moose head,   with a spread 
of seventy inches and over, would 
bring three Lundred dollars and 
upward.    The   Government   has 
stopped   the   shipment   of these 

moose heads" from Alaska, and 
the fur traders grumble.    It is not 
likely tbat the giant  moose and 
bear of the Kenai  peninsula will 
b"e preserved.    A railroad is bulld- 
i ig tl rough that  country; and we 
have records of what railroads do 

to wild game. 
Some furs now comes'to America 

from   Japan,    but   it is not rcry 
valuable, and has not been much 
imported.    All tbe Japan fu-s are 
of bal color—a sort of  "yellow 
peril," tabby-cat'col lor, which is 
quite impossible.    They   do not 
take tbe dye  evenly,   so do not 
roach top prices.    Yon may have 
<>onght a bargain in browu sable, 
*hich was Japan marten  dyed.' 
Or cotrse jou I now that "Alaska 
sable" is plain  skunk,   and that 
•'Japanese bear" is Chinese dog 
or Japauese goat.    The humor of 
the retail fur trade  U Homeric, 
recognising the fact, that geogra- 
phy is not an exact science,   and 
that relatively  few people know 
much about existing fauna. 

It you want to get rich quick, 
find  yourself, some place where 
you can get sea-otter skins.    The 
London market used to show sales 
of 4500 of these  skins   annually. 
Last year there   were only thirty.j 
or forty   otters   retuued from all 
the Alaska coast    A good  skin, 
once worth about three hundred 
dollars, is now worth about twelve 
hundred    dollars, 
whole tribe  of otter-hunting In- 
dians will take   only oi e or two 

skins during tbe year. 

NOTES BY THE WAY 

Ministerial Outing   to the 

Town of Cass, 

The Death of • Stranger in a Strange 

Land.       A Gosd Congregation 

Saturday morning,   November 
tS,  found me on the   morning 
train for Case,   where it was ar- 
ranged  to spend tbe Sabbath in 
worship with  cherished Christian 
friends.    Aa • I had the pleasure 
of having Mamie « ones for trav- 
eling company my attention was 
so much engrossed that I railed to 
pick  up much miscellaneous ma- 
terial for these notes while speed- 
ing along.   U would require more 
time and space than I have at my 
service to write out all that might 
come to mind in the' way of rem- 
iniscences called up by her  pres- 
ence and conversation.    Being a 
daughter of Mr and  Mrs Jared 
Jones,   of Wier, Highland Coun- 
ty, and  a neice of the young be- 
reaved wife of the gallant Confed- 
erate   soldier  whose  burial  wa? 
mentioned in The Times not long 
since, tbe reader can readily un- 
derstand why our meeting on the 
cars would be so interesting to 
me.    Six weeks previously Miss 
Mamie left home for  a visit to 
Augusta County,   thence  to the 
brilliant marriage of an intimate 
lady friend in Henrico/near Rich- 
mond, on the day President Roose 
velt captured the. Virginia metrop 
olis, and she saw htm throw his 
hat at a bear pictured large as life 
on a banner when the crowd call- 
ed so vociferously, "Teddy, shoot 
the Bear!" 

Near her home as she was leav- 
ing her party came up with the 
late Col. D. V. Ruhkman alone 
in his buggy. Ac his invitation 
she rode from Hightown to Mon- 
terey in his company. He was 
in one of his most genial moods. 
Much of the time was passed in 
conversation about mutual friend* 
but it never occurred to either 

that Jhis was to be his last jour- 
ney over over this way familiar 
to him from his childhood- Upon 
reaching Monterey the weathei 
became so inclement that she re 
moastrated with him about going 
any farther, but stay in Monterej 
for rest and comfort.    He mani- 

Some 

ing place during my stay at Cass 
The contrast of Saturday after- 

noon and Sabbath morning at Cass 
is very noticablc and  suggestive. 
Tbe colums of mingled smoke and 
vapour slowly rise  like sombre 
clouds and disappear in the illimi- 
table etberial exi>anse overhead. 
Tbe    incoming   and     deputing 
trains,   freight   and    passenger, 
make one feel that Babel had bro- 
ken loose and was having a good 
time of it around the   big sawmill 
and   depot    Hidden  somewhere 
in the vast sawmill  pile "a   "nig- 
ger" is hidden  away and at fre- 
quent intervals exploits itself in a 
very startling way awLJor theism, 
moment makes one not useditrritf rano 

feel as if all was about to tumble 
to   pieces or be  blown up.    But 
before one can   be fully scared it 
dodges out of sight,   and then be- 
fore the fright wears off and onc'8 
feelings   become   composed,   the 
"nigger"   is up and at it again— 
such fantastic   doings   bring   to 
mind how   governmental" affairs 
were jolted in  1801 from  some- 
thing    Liddcn   in   the    political 
woodpile and may prognosticate 
something mare startling still  in 
times to come. 

But when tho bright Sunday 
morning peeped over the eastern 
tree tops, beautifying all with 
rosy tints and the chrystal Green- 
brier revelling in the sunbeams 
all seemed to be too beautiful for 
reality. When the church bell is 
heard inviting the people to come 
for Sunday school and public wor- 
ship then a pleasing sense of real- 
ity makes one conscious of the 
fact that tbe day of all the week 
the best and emblem of the un- 
ending relief that remains for the 
people of God from sickness and 
sorrow, pain and death, has once 
more come as a sure pledge of all 
the Gospel would haye us hope 

for. 
On the way to ehurch I met a 

conveyance extemporized as a 
hearse conveying the remains of 
a person who had died on Spruce 
FridayCmorning previously. The 
deceased was named Andrew Kil- 
berg, a native of Sweden, and met 
his fate by falling from a bridge 
that was in the act of being finish-' 

SOME BEAR STORIES 

Ancient  and Modern 
History 

Bear 

Last Saturday tbe day after the 
hunting season closed a good track 
Ing snow fell. We are anre 
that no one in thia county would 
sink so low as to kill a 
deer tbe day after the season 
closed but most of us went bear 
or nbbit hunting. Many a deer 
leaped ont before tho hunters but 
the law said "Thou sbalt not," 
and the dea'h dealing-^uns were 

t aa the deer loped out of 

range. 
B. B. Uarabrick, of Clover Lick 

was in town and brought word cf 
a big bear which tried to cross tho 
railroad track at tbe tunnel and 
was scared back off of the right of 
way by the down paaaenger train 
Friday afternoon. 

Mr Uarabrick is a noted bear 
hunter having killed forty Beven 
in his time. He is a son of Peter 
Hambirck of Webster County, 
who is probably the most noted 
bear hunter who ever lived in this 
Stale. Ho killed seventy seven 
one fall. He is still living but in 
poor health. His home is in the 
Elk Valley in Webster county 
just below tbe line and many years 
ago bear and deer were very plent- 

iful in that section.       ;. 
B. B.   Hambrick   says  tbat he 

once killed a bear on Cheat River 
under     peculiar    circumstances. 
The river had been   high and re- 
ceding left  the   pool  iu which  a 
number of suckers were confined 
Thebear had found the suckers and 
was in the pool feeling under  the 
ledges.   He would kill the suckers 
with his paws   and   eat eat them. 
Then he would wait for tbe water 
to  clear and   chase some   more 
under the ledge and  feel around 
uutil he could   press the life out 
of tbem.    After watching for   a 
while he shot and killed the bear. 

He gives an account of a  days 
hunting with his father   when he 
was ten years old.    His father had 
fifteen bear.traps set in-the moun- 

posed of Dave Sharp, Geo 
llobart, Henry Johnson, Jim 
Grimes, Everett Hevener, and 
Lnman Young killed a bear on 
on the Middle Fok cf Williams 
river last week. The bear was 
started in the old slashing and 
three young bounds ran it for three 

or four miles. It was brought to 
bay at tbe foot of a rock and the 
dogs held it until the party bad 
time to come up. The bear 
then chaiged and was killed by 
three shots. It was very fat. 
Ou tbe chase tbe hunters found 
where it bad broken tbe ice on a 
bear wallow to drink and wallow 

in tbe mud. 

-*-«- 
Commissioner'* Sale of Land. 

Pursuant to authority vested in 
me by decree of the Circuit Court 
of Pocahontas County, West 
Virginia, entered on the 28th day 
of November, 1905, in.the chan- 
cery cause of Andrew Price vs 
Samuel B. Woods, the the under- 
signed special commissioner will 

on 

Tuesday, January 9th, 190G. 

tho first day of January term of 
the Circuit court of said county 
at the front door   of   tho   court 
house.of said  county  proceed to 

tains and was going  the arounds. 

ed on the extension of the Spruce He had two dogs which   bad been 

tested much hilarity at tbe idea mains on the way from the station 

railroad. The* fall was about 35 
feet, and though his neck was dis- 
located he lived 36 hours. Only 
two persons  were   with the   re- 

▼ooddeJl-Sharp 

Wednesday December 13tb, 3 
p. m. an interesting society event 

the whole 

lutnbia that 
bo 

occurred *t River view West Mar- 
linton, when Mr, Edgar Boube 
Weoddell and Miss Geneva F. 
Sharp were married while seated 
in their carriage Rev Wm. T. 
Price D. D. officiating minister, 
The groom is a son of tbe late 
Andrew Wooddell and it an 
onergetic working young man 
with good prospects. 

The bride is a daughter of Mr 

Lee Sharp of Frost vicinity it a 
popular young lady, immaliately 
after the oenuony t^ebri^ party 
set out for the home of Mr William 
Dancan on the Greenbrier near 
Buckeye Station where a recaption 

awaited; n amorous circle of friend • 

with tbeee worthy youi people all 

of his trying "to get in out of the 
wet and the cold." It was some- 
thing he-had never yet done and 
gave it as his opinion he would 
have been in his grave years ago 
if he had been afraid of the wea- 
ther. Much of his prosperity and 
prolonged life he attributed to his 
never stopping for frost, snow or 
sleet, but always keep moving 
day and night 

Ere her return the news came 
that he was dead, and so the mor- 
al is deeply impressed on tbe 
minds of all that honor his memo- 
ry no one can be too busy and not 
have to take time for death, and 
ceasing from life's busy,, engross- 
ing duties and absorbing cares. 

Our conversation  was momen- 

Sometimes a torily suspended by the news 
agent proposing to furnish us 
with a pocket dictionary and note 
book all in one. Suffice it to say 
tbat while we failed to furnish 
ourselves in the way so politely 
proposed it did not beep me from 
trying to interpret the language 
of the train as it ran: 

' 'Coming on and coming off, 
Coming again, Fiddlesticks." 

In the meantime Cass loomed 
up like a young city on a hill. I 
had no sooner reached the plat- 
form when my attention was oc- 
cupied by Squire Bird, who turn 
ed ont to be an unrecognized pas- 
senger on the train and was on a 
vi»it to Case. He called my at- 
tention to improvements going on 
and I think We mutually agreed 
tn the opinion that by the time 

circum- 
':-•■-- 

to the Galford buryground just 
beyond the corporate limits. How 

[trite in bis case it was that a hu- 
man life may be drawn through 
various scenes and find its closing 

under deeply pathetic 

stances. 
The audience present was of a 

character that ought to make a 
minister of higher aspirations than 
I aspire to feel complimented by 
iheir presence and attention. At 
the conclusion~bf the services Jas- 
per Slaymaker Matthews, a; rul- 
ing Elder, had me go with him to 
bis cosy home on the bluffs over- 
looking Cass and vicinity, and 
there much of the time was spent 
in a manner ever to be remember- 

ed by me. 
A feW Monday hours were 

spent at the home of the late Al- 
lan C. Burner, who departed from 
his long and strenuous lifo Sep- 
tember 9, 1905, aged IS years 
and 6 days. Much _of his time 
during his last years was occupied 
in reading the Bible and such por- 
tions as were of special benefit to 
him he would underscore. One 
of many such Scriptures is speci- 
ally indicated and reads thus, 
"That if thou shalt confess with 
thy mouth the Lord Jesus and 
shalt believe in thine heart that 
God hath raised Him from the 
dead thou shalt be saved."—Ro- 

mans 10, 9. 
At the station I found a group 

of Italians waiting for the coming 
of the evening train. These sons 

of ancestry that once filled the 
Matlint'1n is   throngh  with her'habitable, world seemed to be in 

k<4aaau Quality shoes 

present 

Poet. 

leveling up enterprises and Cass 
her leveling down undertaking, 

there yet be a noticable sameness 

about tbeee two interesting towns 

on the beautiful Greenbrier. Very 

•bos after parting with the Squire 
I war met by a colored man tent 
by Mrt Dr Arbuckle to meet-no 
at tho train and carry my luggage 
to her pleasant home as my rett- 

contrite, pensive mood- When 
tbe cars appeared all began talk- 
ing and shaking hands. The in- 
toninga of their farewell words 
sounded to my ears toft and dul- 

cet as goslings talk. I imagined 
however their meaning was "May 

God be good to us all and may we 
all meet over the teat at home 
again," V. X, P. 

trained to stop or tree a   bear and 
while trailing they would stay back 
and keep quiet though their   feel- 
ings were such   when tbey  smelt 
a bear that they would bristle and 
swell up to   an   abnormal   size. 
The boy was carrying   a can   of 
honey to bait the traps when they 
came   upon    bear    sign.    They 
followed the trail where the bears 
had scratched the leaves for some 
time until   they  discovered   one. 
The bear reared on his hind Jegs 
and the father shot it down with 
a big   mountain rifle.    The bear 
fell and  bawled which is a sure 
sign that   it has received a death 
wound.   Tbe\bear will oawl then 
and only then.    They  were close 
to a trap and before|the gun could 
be reloaded they  discovered that 
a bear had been caught and  was 
all but out through a hole that he 
had   knawed.    The   dogs     were 
hissed on and held   the bear until 
the gun was loaded and   the bear 
shot    As he   fell in his   dying 
struggles   he   extricated  himself 

from the trap. 
The dogs then took a trail of 

another bear and tho boy was 
left with the two dead bears and 
the father went afetr them and 
did not return until sun down in 
the mean time getting two more 
bears. The boy spent the day in 
a tree and came down at sun set 
when he heard the foot steps of 
his father coming and ran in a 
panic. His father ran him over 
a mile before be could overtake 
all the time headed for the 
wilderness. After disposing of 
the two bears near the pen it was 
midnight before tbey got home. 

On another occasion be was 
with his father in August in the 
mating season and going throngh 

A hacking overgrown with 
briers his father bawled like a 

bear tnd a big he bear eame to 
tbem on a charge. On seeing 
tbem he reared on hit hind legs 

to make an attack and was shot 
so close to the mutate of the gun 

that the for wtt powder burned. 

The bear are  plentiful   in   the 
wood* thia tall,   A party   oom- 

sel.l at public auction to the 
est bidder a tract of land situated 
on the West Branch of Greenbrier 
River containing 1000 acres known 
as the Woods lands being that 
tract on which F. S. Wise & Co. 
have their mill and tjmber opera- 
tion. The timber sold to F. S. 
Wise & Company and other 
rights granted to said Wise & 

Company are c*cepted from this 

sale. 
Terms of Sale:    So   much cash 

in hand as will pay the costs of 
suit and expenses of sale and   for 
the residue upon a credit   of   six 
and twelve months the purchaseer 
giving   interest    bearing    bonds 
with good personal   security,   in 
equal amounts, for   the deferred 
payments, the title to the land to 
be retained as ultimate security. 

L. M. MCCLINTIO. 

Special Commissioner. 

I, J. H.   Patterson,   clerk   of 
the circuit court   of   Pocahontas 
County, West Virginia do hereby 
certify    that   the   above   named 
special commissioner lias excuted 
bond as required by said decree 

<T. H, Patterson Clerk. 

A Very Skk Boy 

On his last visit to his birth- 
place—Hannibal, Missouri—Mark 
Twain told to tho school children 
a true story about a sohoolboy. 

'•This boy" he said "awoke one 
morning very ill. His groans 
alarmed the 'household. Tho 
doctor was sent for aud came 
poste haste. 

" 'Well,' said the doctor, as he 
entered the sick room, ;what is 

•ho trouble!'  . 
" 'A pain iu my side,' said the 

boy. 
" 'Any pain in the head?' 

" 'Yes, air.' 
" 'Is tbe right hand stiff? 
" 'A little.' 
» 'How about the right foot?' 

" 'That's stiff, too.' 
" 'The doctor winked   at   the 

boy's mother. 
" 'Well,' he said, 'you're 

pretty sick. But you'll be able 
to go to school on Monday. Let 
mo   see,   tJ-day     ia     Stturday 
and ' 

" 'Is to-day Saturday?' taid 
the boy in a vexed tone. 'I 
thought it was Friday.' 

"Half an hour later tbat boy 
declared himself healed tnd got 
up. Then they packed him off to 
school, for it   was  Friday,   after 

all." 
- —e—•'*-  

Where the Shoe Pinched 

Jerry—Why did Stella   break 

her engagement with you? 
Tom—Merely because I stole a 

kiss. 
"She must be crazy,   to   object 

to having her fiance steal   a   kiss 
from her." 

"Oh, I didn't   steal   it   from 

her."— 
"Fomilie-Fonmal." 

The Worst to ComC 

Johnson—Is it really true that 
your wife has left you? 

Jamerson—Yes, and that's not 

the worst. ' 
"Why, what do you mean?" 
"I've just had a letter saying 

she's coming back!" 

And Then he Went 

Little Brother (to sister who is 
sitting with her fiance)— 

Do you know what I think? 
Sitter—No; what is it? 
"I think if I were not in tbe 

room Mr Jones would kiss you." 
"You impudent boy! Leave 

the room instantly!"— 

A Business Opportunity 

Rachel—Here    is   your   ring, 
Solomon.    I can    never   marry 
you, for I love another. 

Solomon—Vereias de man  you 

lofel 
"Hoavons!    You    won't    kill 

him, will you?" 
"No but I vill tell him de ring 

dbeep." 

State of West Virginia, 
Pocahontas county,    ss: 
At rules held   in   the .clork't 

office of the circuit court of Poca^-   < 
hontas county, on the first   Mon- 
day in the month   of   December, 

1905. 
A. M. Oliver, administrator of 

tho estates of X. X. Salvator*; 
Frank Steele; Joseph Lucca; 
Bertrin Saldonia; Antonio Sal i 
Jonia, Joseph Rachelo, and Jos- 
eph Saldonia, Plantitf 

V8 ir 
The unknown heirs of   X.   X. 

Salvatore; the unknown heirs of 
Bertrin Saldonia; the unknown 
heirs of Pasqual Saldonia, the 
unknown heirs of Antinio Saldon- 
ia; the unknown heirs of Joseph( 

Rachelo; the unknown heirs of 
Frank Steeld; the unknown heirs 
of Joseph Lucca; unknow heirs of 
Joseph Saldonia, A. M. Oliver 
and A. R. Smith and Paul Smith, 
partners trading at A. R. Smith 
& Son. Defendants. 

The object of suit is to obtain 
instructions how to administer the 
estate of the said X. X. Salvatore, 
Frank Steel, Jos Lucca, Bertrin, 
Saldonia, Pasqual Saldonia, 
Antonio Saldonia, Joseph Rachelo 
and Joseph Saldonia^ and to 
iivide and apportion the fun<T"of 
M52.02, now in the hands of the 
plaintiff as administrator and 
determine the ownerahip thereof. 

This day came the plantiff by 
his attorney, and on his motion, 
and it appearing by affidavit filed, 
that the heirs of X. X. Salvatore, 
Frank Steele, Jos Lucca, Bertrin 
Saldonia, Pasqual Saldonia, 
Autono Saldonia, Joseph Racbelo, 
and Joseph Saldonia, are unknown 
to affiant it is ordered that they 
do appear here within one month 
after tbe date of the first publica- 
tion hereof, and do what ia neccea- 

sary to protect their   interest   in 

this suit. 
Tester      J. H. Patterson, Clerk. 

Andrew Price, Sol." 

A Christmas Present for You! 
- Commencing December 18th, 1905, wewill issueaPriae 

Coupon Ticket Free with every ONE DOLLAR purchase . 
of goods at onr store FOR CASH, and on Christmas even- 
ing, December 25th, at 7-30 o'clock p. m. the stubs of 
said tickets will be mxed and plaeed in a box, and SEV- 
EN TICKETS drawm ont, each of which will entitle the 
holder of its counterpart to a VALUABLE PRIZE. 

Each of tbe first Six, will entitle the holder to a Solid 
Gold Ring,   and the Seventh or Capital  Priae will enti- 
tle the bolder to a 20-year Gold   Filled Ladies or Genta 
Watch,   or  a handGennine Diamond Ring. 

For elegant and lasting presents, having real intrioeto 
value, our store is headquarters^ and gifts of this nat°r* 
not only make the recipient happy for the time being out 
through all the years to come as well. 

Resolve now to visit our store and make your Chriatmaa 
purchases. Tout* for a Merry Chrittmaa^ 

Greenbrier Jewelry Co., 
0. L, Bakle, Manager, 


